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Tiffany Hogan 
 
Tiffany has been a member of NBC since taking a barge class in 1996, although she took an 
extended sabbatical between 2007 and 2015 due to family circumstances.  In her first nine 
years, she was a member of the Masters Women’s Sweeps Team, occasionally taught beginning 
Sweeps classes and served for a year as Club Secretary.  Upon her return, she switched to 
sculling and recently began competing in the single.  For the past two years, she has served on 
the club Governance Committee.  Tiffany is a lifelong athlete, having played Division II softball 
in college, and recently started to compete in bike racing, just to keep things interesting.  
Tiffany has seen a lot of positive change over the years at NBC and looks forward to continuing 
to contribute to club growth.  In her professional life, she runs the Member Experience research 
program at the Commonwealth Care Health Plan of Massachusetts. She is a sociologist by 
training and teaches the Sociology of Aging once a year at Johnson and Wales.  She is a former 
board member of Youth Pride.   
 
 

 
  



Q Kellogg 
 
Q Kellogg joined NBC five years ago and considers it a second home, with great appreciation for 
the community here. She’s learned to row both sweeps and sculls, quickly becoming a serious 
competitor. As a lifelong athlete and competitive cyclist, she brings a steely determination and 
strength to our masters’ team. She has served as Co-Captain of the 2019 Masters’ Sweeps 
Program, and in addition, serves on the NBC Planning Committee.  In her professional career, Q 
is part of the research community at URI, working in Water Resources 
 
 

 
 

Q, center, at Head of the Fish, October, 2019 
 
  



Duuluu (Duulguunnaran) Naranbat  
 
Despite being from Mongolia, a landlocked country, Duuluu learned to row in the US on the 
varsity team at Trinity College in Hartford as a walk-on coached by Kevin MacDermott and 
Brendan Murphy.  Outside of Trinity, Duuluu sculled at Hartford Riverfront Recapture, where he 
was coached by AJ Fournier.  Duuluu made his way to RI in 2020 when he started his PhD 
training in Biomedical Engineering at Brown.  Duuluu joined Narragansett Boat Club as an 
enthusiastic new member, quickly transitioning from sweep rowing to sculling.  He is a 
dedicated member of the Mongolian Rowing Community, an advocate for the Mongolian 
Amateur Rowing Federation, and is motivated to contribute to the NBC community from 
providing a U27 viewpoint to helping with media content creation (including video editing)!  
 

 
 
Duluu at the New England Rowing Championships on Lake Quinsigamond. 


